

SCHOOL BOARD OF BREVARD COUNTY
OFFICE OF PURCHASING SERVICES
2700 JUDGE FRAN JAMIESON WAY
VIERA, FL 32940-6601

BID #09-022/BP – Printing Supplies II –Office of Printing Services

VENDORS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD:

<u>Vendor Name</u>	<u>Estimated Amount Awarded</u>	<u>Item Nos.</u>
Vendor #V0000033071 General Binding Corporation	\$1,622.00	23
Vendor # V0000102164 Unisource	\$14,536.44	3
Vendor # V0000203541 Xerox	\$74,866.50	5
TOTAL	\$91,024.94	

SOLICITATION SUMMARY

Date Solicited: <u>November 20, 2008</u>	Number of Items/Groups:	<u>24</u>
Date Opened: <u>December 19, 2008</u>	No. Firms Solicited:	<u>29</u>
Present to Board: <u>February 10, 2009</u>	No. Firms Bidding:	<u>3</u>

CONTRACT TERM:

6 Months from date of award with the option to renew for one (1) additional 6 month period.

RECOMMENDATION: (Posted: 1/28/2009 – 12:00 p.m.)

It is the recommendation of Mr. Steve Muzzy, Assistant Superintendent for Information Technology and staff to award to the lowest conforming bidder(s) as highlighted in the tabulation for an amount of \$91,024.94. Request authority for the Office of Purchasing Services to renew the contract for One (1) additional 6 month period. Contract renewal shall be contingent upon Print Services' request for continuance of services and contract review.

ACTION BY BOARD:

Approved Recommendation(s) Above & Awarded Meeting Date: _____

Other _____

Lynda Jones,
Director of Purchasing and Warehouse Services

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in s. 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD JUSTIFICATION

The following items were not awarded on this bid because of lack of response from bidders.

1,2,4,6,7,8,9,10,11,12,13,14,15,16,17,18,19,20,21,22,24

**SCHOOL BOARD OF BREVARD COUNTY
OFFICE OF PURCHASING SERVICES
2700 JUDGE FRAN JAMIESON WAY
VIERA, FL 32940-6601**

December 22, 2008

TO: BIDDERS ON PRINTING SUPPLIES

FROM: Becky Prosser - Buyer

RE: Bid #09-022/BP – Printing Supplies II – Printing Services

TABULATION

Listed below for your information is a Tabulation of bids received on the above captioned matter. This is a Tabulation only, and Award of orders will be made at a later date.

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
1.	AQUEOUS PLATES Must specify brand. No commingling, all items must be compatible. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder.				
	A) Metal Plates, Neg. Acting,.005, 2 Sided, 13 x 19 3/8, PB Grained 100 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) Metal Plates, Neg. Acting, 2 Sided, 13 3/16 x 19 3/32, SC Grained 100 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
	C) Metal Plates, Neg. Acting, .008 Ryobi 580, 20 x 22 5/8, SC Grained 200 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	D) Metal Plates, Neg. Acting, Ryobi 3200 PFA, 11 x 18 1/2, Pin Bar Grained 200 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	E) 2 In One Developer w/Gum, 1 gal containers 24 gallons	NO BID			
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 1-A THRU 1-E	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
2.	SILVER PLATE SUPPLIES (Polyester Only) Mitsubishi Products Must specify brand. No commingling, all items must be compatible. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder.				
	A) Silver Plate 8mm, 21 5/8" x 200' Mega Plus 10 rolls	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
	B) Silver Plate, 12 ½" x 200' Mega Plus 6 rolls	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	C) Developer, 1 gal. container 12 gallons	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	D) Stabilizer, 1 gal container 8 gallons	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Price Per Unit				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	E) Etch 1 qt, container 12 Quarts	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	F) Fountain Concentrate 1 gal. container 12 gallons	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
	G) Imaging Film, 13.3" x 100', Spec. #867, Emulsion #8731-60-745-0 18 rolls	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	H) Silver Digiplate, Film for LD SDP-FD175, 13.3" X 100', Spec. #820, Emulsion #J2214 18 rolls	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 2-A THRU 2-H				

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	
3.	INK: VANSON ONLY Must specify brand. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder.				
	A) INK, Rubber Base, Black, 5 lb can 100 cans	NO BID			NO BID
	Unit Cost			\$84.94	
	Total Cost			\$8,494.00	
	Notes				
	B) INK, Oil Base, Dutch Fireball Red, PMS 185, 5lb can 5 cans	NO BID			NO BID
	Unit Cost			\$69.81	
	Total Cost			\$349.05	
	Notes				
	C) INK, Oil Base, Reflex, Blue, 5 lb can 5 cans	NO BID			
	Unit Cost			\$69.81	NO BID
	Total Cost			\$349.05	
	Notes				
	D) INK, Oil Base, Med. Blue, 5 lb can 5 cans	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
E)	INK, Oil Base, Amazon Green, OB 2534, 5lb can 10 cans	NO BID			NO BID
	Unit Cost			\$138.97	
	Total Cost			\$1,389.70	
	Notes				
F)	Ink, Oil Base, Irish green, 5 lb can 5 cans	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
G)	INK, Oil Base Bordeaux, 5 lb can 5 cans	NO BID			NO BID
	Unit Cost			\$137.76	
	Total Costs			\$688.80	
	Notes				
H)	INK, Oil Base, PMS 321, 5 lb can 5 cans	NO BID			NO BID
	Unit Cost			\$91.99	
	Total Costs			\$459.95	
	Notes				
I)	INK Oil Base, Pantone Violet, 1lb can 5 cans	NO BID			NO BID
	Unit Cost			\$36.39	
	Total Costs			\$181.95	
	Notes				

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
	J) INK Oil Base, Med. Gold, Metallic, 1 kilo can 10 cans	NO BID			NO BID
	Unit Cost			\$98.44	
	Total Costs			\$984.40	
	Notes				
	K) INK, Oil Base, Silver Metallic, 1 kilo can 2 cans	NO BID			NO BID
	Unit Cost			\$61.77	
	Total Costs			\$123.54	
	Notes				
	L) INK, Process Yellow, VS 746, 5 lb can 10 cans	NO BID			NO BID
	Unit Cost			\$47.95	
	Total Costs			\$479.50	
	Notes				
	M) INK, Process Magenta, VS 747, 5 lb can 10 cans	NO BID			NO BID
	Unit Cost			\$52.18	
	Total Costs			\$521.80	
	Notes				
	N) INK, Process Cyan, VS 748, 5 lb can 10 cans	NO BID			NO BID
	Unit Cost			\$51.47	
	Total Costs			\$514.70	
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 3-A THRU 3-N	NO BID		\$14,536.44	NO BID

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
4.	PRESS SUPPLIES II				
	Must specify brand. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder.				
	A) Vanson Disposable Gloves 100/box 10 boxes	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) Roller Cleaner, Easy Street, tube 10 tubes	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	C) 4" x 4" Cotton Pads, 100 pkg. 50 packages	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	D) Blanket Wash, Water Miscible 5 gal container 20 containers	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	E) Padding Cement 1 gal container 5 gallons	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 4-A THRU 4-E	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
5.	CARBONLESS PAPER – PRE-COLLATED ONLY – ALL SHEETS 20 LB. Must specify brand. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder.				
	I. 8.5 x 11				
	A) 2 part – White, Yellow - Reverse 1,500,000 each	NO BID			
	Unit Cost			\$11.30/M	\$10.37/M
	Total Cost			\$16,950.00	\$15,555.00
	Notes				
	B) 3 part – White, Yellow, Pink – Reverse and/or Straight 1,500,000 each	NO BID			
	Unit Cost			\$12.60/M	\$11.68/M
	Total Cost			\$18,900.00	\$17,520.00
	Notes				
	C) 4 part – White, Yellow, Pink, Gold Reverse and/or Straight 1,500,000 each	NO BID			
	Unit Cost			\$13.43/M	\$12.48/M
	Total Cost			\$20,145.00	\$18,720.00
	Notes				

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
	D) 5 part – White, Green, Yellow, Pink, Gold - Reverse and /or Straight 1,500,000 each	NO BID			
	Unit Cost			\$13.78/M	\$12.92/M
	Total Cost			\$20,670.00	\$19,380.00
	Notes				
	II. 8.5 x 14 SHORT GRAIN				
	A) 2 part – White, Yellow, - Reverse 100,000 each	NO BID			
	Unit Cost			\$14.16/M	\$13.34/M
	Total Cost			\$1,416.00	\$1,334.00
	Notes				
	B) 3 part – White, Yellow, Pink – Reverse and/or Straight 50,000 each	NO BID			
	Unit Cost			\$15.82/M	\$14.87/M
	Total Cost			\$791.00	\$743.50
	Notes				
	C) 4 part – White, Yellow, Pink, Gold Reverse and/or Straight 50,000 each	NO BID			
	Unit Cost			\$16.87/M	\$15.97/M
	Total Cost			\$843.50	\$798.50
	Notes				

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
	D) 5 part - White, Green, Yellow, Pink, Gold – Reverse and/or Straight 50,000 each	NO BID			
	Unit Cost			\$17.35/M	\$16.31/M
	Total Costs			\$867.90	\$815.50
	Notes				
	III. NCR FAN-APART PADDING COMPOUND, 1 GAL CONTAINER Must be compatible with items 5-I. & 5-II. 10 gallons	NO BID			NO BID
	Unit Cost			\$85.79	
	Total Costs			\$857.90	
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 5-I THRU 5-III	NO BID		\$81,440.90	\$74,866.50
6.	INDEX – 110 LB. – 23 x 35 Must specify brand. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder.				
	A) White 30,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) Regular Colors 10,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 6-A & 6-B	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
7.	INDEX – 110 LB. – 8 1/2 X 11 Must specify brand. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder				
	A) White				
	30,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) Regular Colors				
	10,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 7-A & 7-B	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
8.	INDEX – 110 LB. – 11 X 17 Must specify brand. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder				
	A) White				
	30,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) Regular Colors				
	10,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	TOTAL COSTS OF ITEMS 8-A & 8-B				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 6,7,8	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
9.	COVER 65 LB. LINEN – 8 1/2 X 11 (Include Swatch) Must match color of items #9 & #10. Must specify brand. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder.				
	A) Regular Colors 7,500 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) Bright Hue 5,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
10.	COVER 65 LB. LINEN PAPERS – 23 X 35 (Include Swatch) Must match colors of items 11-15				
	A) Regular Colors 5,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) Bright Hue 5,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
11.	20 LB. DUPLICATOR PAPER 8.5 X 11 – RECYCLED (INCLUE SWATCH)				
	A) Regular Colors 50,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) Brite Hue 40,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
12.	BASIS 60 LB. OFFSET, OPAQUE COLORS –RECYCLED (Include Swatch)				
	A) 8 ½ x 11 White 250,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) 8 ½ x 11 Astro Brights 20,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	C) 8 ½ x 14 White 10,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	D) 8 ½ x 14 Astro Brights 10,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 10 thru 12	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
13.	60 LB. OFFSET, SMOOTH – RECYCLED (Include Swatch)				
	A) 11 X 17 White 1,500,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	C) 11 x 17 Color 1,500,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
14.	COATED STOCK – 23 X 35 (Include Swatch) Must specify brand. Must bid all items 14 - 16. Will be awarded to overall low bidder.				
	A) Cast Coated, 12 pt., CCIS Cover 20,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) Cast Coated, 10 pt., CCIS Cover 20,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
15.	COATED STOCK – 11 X 17 (Include Swatch)				
	A) Cast Coated, 8 pt., CCIS Cover 20,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Costs				
	Notes				
	B) Cast Coated, 10 pt., CCIS Cover 50,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
	C) Dull Coated, 80 lb., Text 100,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	D) Cast Coated, 12 pt. CCIS Cover 10,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
16.	CAST COATED, 12 X 18 (Include Swatch)				
	A) Coat Coated, 10 pt. CCIS Cover 5,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 14 THRU 16	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
17.	FAST TRACK – 8.5 X 11, SMOOTH COAT (Include Swatch) Must specify brand. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder.				
	A) White 2,500 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) Regular Colors 1,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 16 & 17	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
18.	65 LB PARCHMENT COVER – 8.5 X 11 (Include Swatch) Must match colors of items 17 & 18. Must specify brand. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder.				
	Regular Colors				
	5,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
19.	60 LB PARCHMENT TEXT – 8.5 X 11 (Include Swatch)				
	Regular Colors				NO BID
	35,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 18 & 19	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
20.	STATIONERY PAPERS, RECYCLED (Include Swatch) Must specify brand. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder.				
	A) White Woven, Sub 24, 8 ½ x 11				
	200,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) Classic, Sage Green, 24 lb, Crest, 8 ½ x 11				
	50,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
	C) Classic, Sage Green Matching Envelopes, Crest 25,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	D) # 10 Window Envelopes, White 25,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	E) #10 Plain Envelopes, White 75,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	F) 7 x 10 Plain Clasp Envelopes, Brown 50,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF 20-A Thru 20-F	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
21.	FIRST CHOICE BRITE WHITE LASER (Include Swatch) Must specify brand. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder.				
	A) 8 ½ x 11 20,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) 11 x 17 50,000 each	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 21-A & 21-B	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
22.	BINDERY SUPPLIES				
	Must specify brand. Must bid all items. Will be awarded to overall low bidder				
	A) Shipping Cartons – Recycled 17 ½ x 11 ½ x 11 ½, 25/bundle 200 Bundles	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	B) Shipping Cartons Jr. – Recycled 11 ¼ x 8 ¾ x 11 1/2, 25/bundle 40 Bundles	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	C) Stationery Boxes – Recycled – 11 1/8 x 5 5/8 x 2, 100/box 100 boxes	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	D) Stationery Boxes – Recycled – 11 3/8 x 8 7/8 x 4, 100/box 100 boxes	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				

		General Binding Corporation		Unisource	Xerox
Item	Description Est. Quantity	Amount Bid		Amount Bid	Amount Bid
	E) Stationery Boxes – Recycled – 14 3/8 x 8 7/8 x 2, 100/box 50 Boxes	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
	Unit Cost				
	Total Cost				
	Notes				
	TOTAL COST OF ITEMS 22A Thru 22E	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
23.	TABS Must specify brand				
	5 bank, 90lb index, White – un-punched – single reversed collated, 250/box, 5 boxes/case or specify quantity per box _____ & boxes per case: _____ 25 cases				
	Unit Cost	\$64.88 Box		NO BID	NO BID
	Total Cost	\$1,622.00			
	Notes	250 Sets per box & boxes per case = 1			
24.	LAMINATION MATERIAL – 38" X 250' – 3 Mil – Matte Finish, 2 1/4" core diameter				
	16 rolls				
	Unit Cost	\$106.42		NO BID	NO BID
	Total Cost	\$1,702.56			
	Notes	Naplam II Film P/N 3017804			

BIDDER'S NOTES

BID #09-022/BP - PRINTING SUPPLIES- PRINTING SERVICES

Vendor	Time Required for Delivery	Contract Term
Vendor # V0000033071 General Binding Corporation 300 Tower Parkway Lincolnshire, IL 60069 Phone: 800-222-6462 Fax: 847-484-4226 Rep: Richard Krachey bidbase@gbc.com	3-5 Days ARO	6 Months from Date of Award
Vendor # V0000102164 Unisource Worldwide, Inc. 4151 Woodcock Drive Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone: 800-631-1955 Fax: 800-224-8799 Rep: Kevin Loveland	7 Days ARO	6 Months from Date of Award
Vendor # V0000203541 Xerox 8706 Glenberg Ct. S. Jacksonville, FL 32256 Phone: 904-519-0128 Fax: 866-540-0523 Rep: Jay Abraham Jay.abraham@xerox.com	7 Days ARO	6 Months from Date of Award